

**FOI Request: Corrective Surgery Costs**  
**Our Reference Number: 1314358**

***I am writing to request information about the cost to the NHS of corrective surgery done to correct botched cosmetic surgery done abroad during the last 12 months.***

***a) Numbers of procedures carried out to correct botched surgery for:***

***i. any procedures other than remedying health state (Z41)***

***ii. follow-up care involving plastic surgery (Z42).***

***Please break these figures down into sub-divisions by type of procedure e.g. Z41.1 etc***

The CCGs do not hold this information; it is not recorded in the fashion you have requested.

Information could be provided in relation to all patients treated under the above codes, Z41 & Z42, but this does not differentiate whether the treatment was carried out in relation to "botched" surgery.

***b) Cost break-down for each of these procedures***

As above, we do not hold this information.

***c) Where the original, botched operation that needed correcting took place***

We do not hold this information.