

FOI Request: Perinatal Mental Health
Our Reference Number: 1314448

1. Does your CCG have in place a perinatal mental health strategy and can you provide me with a copy of the strategy?

The CCGs do not have a strategy.

2. Does your CCG provide a specialist perinatal mental health service?

No, this is commissioned by the Specialist Commissioning Group within NHS England.

3. The proportion of live births for 2013 within the locality of your CCG?

We do not hold this information; this should be available from the local acute trusts as provider of maternity services. Information on how to submit a FOI request to them is available here: Southend University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (provider for NHS Castle Point & Rochford CCG and NHS Southend CCG) - [www.southend.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-of-information-\(foi\)/](http://www.southend.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-of-information-(foi)/)

4. The number of midwives with specialist perinatal mental health training within the locality of your CCG for 2013.

We do not hold this information. It would be held by the employer of midwives, the local acute trusts as provider of maternity services. Please see response to Q3 for information on how to submit a FOI request to them.

5. The number of GPs with specialist perinatal mental health training within the locality of your CCG for 2013.

We do not hold this information. This should be available from NHS England, who has responsibility for primary care services. Information on how to submit a FOI request to them is available here: www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/

6. The number of patients referred by a GP, midwife or health visitor to your CCG's specialist perinatal mental health service, if such a service was in place, for 2013.

We do not hold this information. This should be available from NHS England, as the commissioner of both GP services and the specialist perinatal mental health service. Please see Q5 for information on how to submit a FOI request to them.